M-302
L.-T646

Y of Pahistan

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

REGISTERED No.
-
S8

The Gajette

ISLAMABAD, SUNDAY, MARCH 21, 1993

PART I
Acts, Ordinances, President’s Orders and Regulations
NATIONAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT
Tslamabad, the 215t March, 1993

The following Act of Majlis-e-Shoora (Parliament) received the assent of the
President on the 18th March, 1993, and is hergby published for general information:

ACT Mo, IT1 oF 1993

An Act further to amend the Members of Parliament { Salaries and Allowances)
Aet, 1974

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Members of Parliament (Salarics
and Allowances) Act, 1974 (XXVII of 1974), for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows;—

1. Short title and commencement.—{1) This Act may be called the Members of
Parliament {Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 1993,

{2) It shall come into force at crnce;
(69)

Price: Ps. 30

[3278/Ex. Gaz]



—

5

70 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA.. MARCH 21. 1993 [PART 1

2, Amendment of section 4, Act XXVII of 1974,—In the Members of Parliament
{Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1974 (XXVII of 1974), hereinafter referred to as the
said Act, in section 4, in sub-section (1),—

{a) for the words “one hundred and fifty™ the words “three hundred™ shall
be substituted: and

(b) [for the words “one hundred” the words “two hundred” shall be
substituted.

3. Insertion of section 4B, Act XXVII of 1974.—In the said Act. after section
4A, the following new section shall be inserted. namely:—

“4B. Sumptuary Allowance —A member shall receive sumptuary
allowance at the rate of two thousand rupees per mensem,”.

4. Amendment of section 5, Act XXVIIof 1974.—In the said Act. in section 3. in
sub-section (1), in clause (c). for the words “two rupees” the words “three rupees’ shall

be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 6, Act XX V11 of 1974.—In the said Act. in section b, in
clause (c). for the word “two™ the word “three™ shall be substituted.

f.. Amendment of section 9, Act XXVII of 1974.—In the said Act. in section 9.
for the words “three hundred™ the words ““four hundred and fifty™ shall be substituted.

7. Amendment of section 10, Act XXVII of 1974.—In the said AcL in section
10, —

{a) in sub-section (1).—

(i) for the words “thirty thousand™ the words “forty-five thousand”
shall be substituted: and

(i)  in the proviso. for the words “thirty thousand™ the words “farty-
five thousand™ shall be substituted: and

(b} in sub-section {2).—

(i) for the words “twenty thousand™ the words “thirty thousand™
shall be substituted: and

(ii) for the words “thirty thousand™ the words “forty-five thousand™
shall be substituted,



A

ParT I] THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA.. MARCH 21, 1993 71

8. Amendment of section 11, Act XXVII of 1974.—In the said Act, in section 11,
for the words “two thousand™ the words “four thousand”™ shall be substituted.

9. Amendment of section 11A, Act XXVII of 1974.—In the said Act, in section
T1A, for the words “three thousand™ the words “five thousand” shall be substituted.

K. A. GORAYA,
Secretary General.

PRINTED BY THE MANAGER, PRINTING CORPORATION OF PAKISTAN PRESS, ISLAMABAD
PUBLISHED BY THE MANAGER OF FUBLICATIONS, KARACHI,




