
Cr:-sj
REGISIERED No. s raasm.

@,W $alette of {pohirtrn

I

EXTRAOROINARY
PUBLISI{ED BY AUTHORITY

ISLAMABAD, WEDNESDAY, JULY 2I, 1976

PART I
Acts, Oriliuances, Presidenl's Orders and R€guletioN

NATIONAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT

Islqnwbad, the 21st July, 1976

The following Acts of Parliament received the assent of the President on
the 16th July, 1976, ar,d are hcreb-v published for general information:-

-tCT No. L oF t976

An Act lutther to unrcnd the Pqkistan Anns Ordinoace, 1965

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Pakistan Arms Ordinance,
1965 (W.P. Ordinance No. XX ot 1965), for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

1. Shoft title, extetrt anal comm-ncement. ( l) This Act may be called lhe
Pakistan Arms (Amendment) AcL, 1976.

(2) It extends to the whole of Pakistan.

(3) It shall come into force at once.

2. IBertiotr o[ new section l4A, W. P. Ordinance No, XX of 1965.-In tbe
Pakistan Arms Ordinance, 1965 (W. P. Ordinance No. XX of 1965), after section
14, the following new sectioll shall be inserted, namely :-

" l4A. Certqtu olJences triable b1 Muqislrates. (l) Notwithstanding an)-
thing contained in the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1898 (Act V of
1898), an ollence punishable under section 13 or section 14 shall,
unless it has been committed in respect of any o[ the arms, ammttnition
or military Jtores referred to in the proviso to tbe said section [3,
be triable by a Magislrate of the flrst class.

(2) Alt cases relating to ofteDces triable by a Magistrate oI the first
class under sub-section (l) and pending in a Court of Session

(423)

Price : Ps. 25

{2664 Ex. Gaz.)



Q:t2424 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXIRA., rIJLy 21. 1976 [pARr I

immediately before lie commencemeit of the Pakistan Arms
(A-nendment) Ordinance, 1976 (XXI ot 1976), in which the charge
had not been framed shall, on such commencement, stand transfefiEd
to the Court of the Magistrate of the f.rst class havhg jurisdiction over
such cases. ".

5. Amendrrent of section 15, Act XXXIX of 1952.-In the said Act, in
seation 15, in sub-section (l), for tbe full etop at the end a colon shall be sub-
stituted and thereafter the follos.ing proviso shall be added, namely:-

3. RcpeBL-Tbe Pakistan Arms (Amendment) Ordinanoe, 1976 (XXI ot
1975), is hereby repealed.

ACT No. Ll or ry76

An Act lurther to amend. the Pakistan Arnry Act, 1952

WHEREAS it is expedient furtler to amend the Pakistan Army Act, tg'2
OOO(D( ot 1952), and to rep€al the Commander-in-Chief (Delegation of
Powers) Ordinance, 197I (Yl ot l97l), for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

l. Sbo title and comtrencemetrt.-(1) This Act may be called the Pakistan
Army (Amendment) Act, 1976.

(2) It shall come into forc€ at once.

2. Amndment of sec"tion 3, Act XXXD( of 1952.-In the said Act, in
seaion 3, in sub-section (l), after the word, brackets and letter " clauss (c) ",
lhe words, brackets atrd letter " or clause (d) " shall be inserted.

3. AmondmeDt ot seclion 8, Ad XXXIX o[ 1952.-In the said Act, in
s€ctiotr 8,-

(i) for clause (2) the following shall be substituted, nameiy:--

" (2) " Chief of the Army Stafi " means the Ofncer commanding thc
Pakislan Army ;

(3) " civil offence " means an offence which, if committed in Pakistar,
would be triable by a criminal court. ": and

(ii) for clause (12) the following shall be substituted, namely:

(12) "officer" means a porson, other than a junior commissioned
ofiicer, commission€d, gazetted or in pay as an officer of the
Pakistan Army and includes, io relation to a person subject
to this Act when serving under such conditions as mar bi
prescribed, an officer of the Pakistan Navy and an officer of
the Pakistan Air Force, ".

4. Onission of section 9A, Act XXXIX of 1952.-In the said Act, section
9,A shall be omitted.



@v
PARr ll THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN,'EXTRA., JULY 21. 1976 42s

" Provided that, i{ the p€rson to be attested is a Muslim, this sec-
tion shall have effect as if reference therein to amrmation were
omitted. ".

6. Omission of section l5A, Act XXXIX of 1952.-In the said Act. sec-
tion 15A shall be omitted.

7. Amendment of section 20, Act XXXIX oI 1952.-In the said Act. itr
section 20, in sub-section (3), for the words " transportation or imprisonment "
the words " imprisonment for life or for a shorter term " shall be substitutcd.

8. Ameordment ot section 35. Aca XXXIX oI 1952.-In the said Act, in
section 36, in sub-section (1), for the words and comma " for the first offence
with rigorous imprisoDment for a term which may extend to two years or with
such less punishment as is in this Act mentioned, and for the second or any
subsequent ofience with rigorous imprisonment for a telm which may extend to
tsn years " the words " with rigorous imprisonment for a term which may ex-
tend to five years " shall be substituted.

9. Amedmmt of section 37, Act XXXD( ot 1952.-In the said Act, in
section 37 for the words "five years " the words " three years " shall be substi-
tuted.

10. Ametrdmed of section zlt, Act XXXIX of 1952.-In the said Act, in
section 48, in clause (a) for the word " of " the word " or " shall be substitut-
ed.

11. Amendment of scction 59. Act XXXIX of 1952.-In the said Act. in
section 59, in sub-section (l),-

(b) in clause (b), the word " with ", occurring twico, shall be omitted

12. Am€ndmetrt o[ section 60, Act XXXIX of 1952.-In the said .A.cr. in
section 60,-

(i) for clause (b) the following shall b€ substituted, narnely:-

" (b) imprisonment for life ; " ; and

(ii) in the proviso, in clause (l), for the word " transportation " the
words " imprisonment for life " shall be substituted.

(a) in clause (a). for the word " transporl"ation " the words " imprison-
meDt for life " shall be substituted ; and

13. Amendme of section 62, Aca XXXIX oI 1952.-Itr the said Act, in
section 62. sub-sections (l), (2) and (5), for the word " transportation " thc
words " imprisonment for life " shall be substituted.

14. Amcndment ot section 63, Ad XXXIX of 1952,-In the said Act, in
section 63, for the word " transportation ", wherever occurring, the words "im-
prisonment for life " shall be substituted.



Lzzal
426 THE CAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., JULY 21, 1976 [PART I

15. Amendme of section 65, Act XXXIX of 1952.-In the said Act, in
Eection 65, in sub-section (2,. -

(i) in clause (a), the word and
omitted I and

comma " transportation, " shall be

(ii) in the Explanation, in 'paragraph (iv), tlre word and comma
" tratrsportatioo, " shall be omitted.

16. Amendment o[ section 7E, Act XXXIX oi 1952.-In the said r\ct. rn
section 78,-

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words " sixty days" the words '' tlirty
days" shall be substituted: and

(b) after sub-section (2), the following new sub-section shall be addcd
namely :-
" (3) Notwithstanding anything contai-oed jn sub-section (l), a person

who, after enroknent, fails to report to the corps or uxr,it to
which he is required to report within thirty days of the datc on
which he was required to so report, the commanding ofic.er of
the corps or unit shall declare such failure and ent€r in the court
martial book oI the corps or unit. as the casc nray bc. a record
of the declaration; and if the person in respcct of whom such
declaration has been made does not afterwards surrencier, or is
not apprehended, he shall, for the purposes of tbis Act, be
deemed to b€ a deserter. ".

. 17. Amendmetrt of section E9, Act XXXIX ot 1952.-In the said Act, in
section 89, in sub-section (2), the words " of the judge advocate or " shall
bc omitted.

18. Amendment ot section 92, Act XXXIX ot 1952.--In the said Act, in
section 92, ia sub.section (2), in the proviso, after the word ard flgure " sec-
tion 3l " the \vords and figure "or section 40" shall be inserted.

19. Aneldnen( of sectiou 98, Act XXXIX of 1952.-In the said Act, in
section 98, for the word " transportation " the words " imprisonment for life "
sball be substituted.

20. Ameodment of section 101, Act XXXIX of 1952.-In the said Act,
il settion 101, for the word " transportation " the words " imprisonment for
life " shall be substituted.

21. Insertion o[ new section 10EA, Act XXXIX of 1952.-Io the said Act,
after section 108, the fotlowing new section shall be inserted, namely:-

" 108A. Affirnatirrn not qllowed in the cqse ol Muslim.-Where the
person referred to in section 106 or section 107 or sectioq 108 is
a Muslim" the said section shall have efiect as if referenrce therein
to afrrmation wEre omitted. "



[:au
PARr II THE GABTTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., Jltl-Y 21, 1916 4n

22. Amendment of section lU. Lct XXXIX of 1952.-In the said Act,
in section 12,-

(a) for the words " transportation for life " the words " inprisonoeat
for life " shall be substituted;

(b,l in the first proviso, -
(i) for the word " transportation " the words " imprisonment for

life " shall be substituted: and

(ii) for the colon at the end a full stop shall be substituted; and

(c) the second proviso shall be omitled.

23. Amendment of section f31, Act XXXIX of 1952,-In the said Act,
rn section 131, in sub-section (l), for the words and cornma " prescribed officer,
provided that such prescrjbed officer is higher in rank than " the words " pres-
cribed offi.cer who is superior in command to " shall be substituhd.

24. Amendment of section 135, Act XXXIX ot 1952.-In the said Act,
in section 135, for the word " tra.usportation " the words " imprisonment for
life " shall be substituted.

25. Amendm€nt of section 136, Act XXXD( of f952.-In the said Act,
in section 136, for the word " Eanspofiation ", thrice occurring, the words
" imprisonment for life " shall be substituted.

26. Omission oI section 139, Act XXXIX of 1952.-In the said Act
section 139 shall be omitted.

27. AEetrdmetrt of section 140, Act XXXIX of 1952.-In the said Act,
in section 140, for the word " transportation " the words " imprisonment for
life " shall be substitut€d.

28. Anendment of section 143. Act XXXIX ol 1952,-In the said Act,
in section 143,-

(i) in sub.section (t), in the proviso, the words and comma " kaDs-
portation shall not be commuted for a sentenc€ of rigororis im-
prisonment for a term excteding the term of transportatlon award-
ed by the court, atrd a sentence of" shall be omitted; and

(ii) in sub-section (2), in the proviso, for [he word " transportation "
the words " imprisonment for life " shall be substituied.

29. Ametrdment of section 144, Act XXXIX of 1952.-In the said Act,
in section 144, for the word " transportation " the words " imprisonment for
life " shall be substituted.

30. Arendment of section 166, Act XXXIX of 1952'-In the said Act,
in section 156, in clause (1) for the words "sixty days " the words " thirty
days " shall be substituted.

31. Amendment ol section 176' Act XXXIX of 1952.-ln the said Act.
in scct,on 175, in sub.scction (2), in clause (i), for the word " trensportatim "
the words " imprisotrme[t for lile " shall be substituted.



r...},y.
428 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISIAN, EXTRA., JULY 2I, 1976 [P-\RT 1

32. Insertion o{ new sections 1768, 176C a[d 176D, Act XXXIX ot
1952.-In the said Act, after sectio[ 1764, the foltowing new sections shall be
inserted, namely :-

*1768. Reterenee to Commq der-in-Chief in other Laws.--Reteretce in
any law, and in any rule, regulation, bye"law, notincation, order,
warrant, bond, document or other instrument made or issued under
any law, to the ' Commander-in-Chiet " in relation to the Pakistan
Army shall be construed as reference to the Chief of the Army Staft.

176C. Delegation ol powcrs of the Chiel ol the Army Sraf.-(l) Federal
Government may, by order in writing, authorise the officer appoi-nted
as Deputy Chiet of the Army Sta{t to exercise and perform, during
any period when the Chief of the AJmy Staff is absent on leave or
oLherwise, all or any of the powers and functions vested in him, as
such Chief of the Army Staff, under any law or under any rules,
regulations, orders and instructions for the time being in force.

(2) The Deputy Chiel of the Anry StalT shall excrcise the powers
and perform the functions conferred upon him under sub.section (1)
in accordance with such general or special direc[ions as may be
given in that behalt by the Federal Goverffnent.

176D. Validat;on.-AlJy power or function of the Commander-in-Chief,
Pakistan Army, which has been exercised or performed by the Chief
of Slaff of the Pakistan Army or the Chief of the Army Staff or by
an acting Chief of Staff of the Pakistan Army or by an acting Chief
of the Army Staff or by an oflicer under the command or the
authority of any of them at any time on or after the third day of
March, 1972,, and before the commencement of the Pakistan Army
(Amendnlent) Act, t976, shall be decnred to have been validly ex-
ercised or performed as if the Chief of Stafl of the Pakistan Army,
or the Chief of the Army Stall or the acting Chief of Stafi of the
Pakistan Army or the acting Chief of the Army Stafi or such other
ofrcer as aforesaid, as the case mav be, were duly authorised to
exercise such power or perform such function. ".

33. Omission ot Chapter XYI, Act XXXIX ot 1952.-In the said Act,
Chapter XVI shall be omitted.

34. R€Ircal.-The Commander-in-Chiel (Delegation ot Powers) Ordinauce,
1971 (VI of 1971), is hereby repealed.

M. A. HAQ,
Secretary.

PhINTED I}Y 'IHE \IA\{CI]R, PRIN'IIN(, CORPCITAI ION OF PAKISTAN PRESS, ISLAITIAB-!\D
PUBLiSIII]D I]Y THE \IANACEI{ OF PUI]LICI TIONS, KARiCHI




