REPORT OF THE SENATE STANDING COMMITTEE ON FINANCE,
REVENUE AND ECONOMIC AFFAIRS

REPORT OF THE SENATE STANDING COMMITTEE ON FINANCE
REVENUE AND ECONOMIC AFFAIRS ON “TAX LAWS (THIRD
AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2021”, REFERRED BY THE HOUSE IN
ITS SITTING HELD ON 10™ NOVEMBER, 2021

PRESENTED BY
SENATOR MUHAMMAD TALHA MAHMOOD
CHAIRMAN




SENATE SECRETARIAT

REPORT OF THE SENATE STANDING COMMITTEE ON FINANCE
REVENUE AND ECONOMIC AFFAIRS ON “TAX LAWS (THIRD
AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2021”, REFERRED BY THE HOUSE IN
ITS SITTING HELD ON 10™" NOVEMBER, 2021

I, Senator Muhammad Talha Mahmood, Chairman of the Standing Committee On
Finance, Revenue and Economic Affairs have the honour to present, on behalf of the
Committee, this report on the Bill titled “Tax Laws {Third Amendment) Ordinance, 2021%,
referred by the Senate in its sitting held on 10" November, 2021 to the Committee for
consideration and report.

2. The composition of the Commiitee is as under:
1. Senator Muhammad Talha Mahmood Chairman
2. Senator Dr. Shahzad Waseem (Leader of the House) Member
3. Senator Syed Shibli Faraz Member
4. Senator Farooq Hamid Mask Member
5. Senator Saleem Mandviwala Member
6. Senator Shemry Rehman Member
7. Senator Mohsin Aziz Member
4. Senator Kamil Ali Agha Member
9. Senator Musadik Masood Malik Member
10. Senator Dilawar Khan Member
11. Senator Anwaar ul Haq Kakar Member
12, Senator Saadia Abbasi Member
13. Senator Syed Faisal Ali Subzwari Member
14, Senator Faisal Saleem Rehman Member
15, Minister for Finance, Revenue and Economic Affairs Ex-Officio Member
3 The following members attended the meeting on 18 November, 2021:
1. Senator Muhammad Talha Mahmood Chairman
2. BSenator Saleem Mandviwala Member
3. Senator Sherry Rehman Member
4. Senator Mohzin Aziz | Member
5. Senator Kamil Ali Agha Member
6. Senator Musadik Masood Malik Member
4, The Chairman Committee welcomed the members and participants of the Commitige,

The officials from FBR briefed the Committee about the overall purpose of the money bill.
During Clause by Clause discussion on the Bill, various reservations were made and dissents
noted. Senator Sherry Rehman voted against Sub-Clause (2) of Clause (2), of the bill.
Furthermore, Senator Musadik Mascod Malik registered his dissent upon sub-clause (2), of
Clause (4), of the said bill, and asserted that laws should be in line with the principles of the
governance for efficient imp]Ementatiq%

Y 2



5. After thorough discussion on the Tax Laws (Third Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 , the
Committee recommends the following amendments:-

1. Amendments of Customs Act, 1969 (IV of 1969): In the Customs Act, 1969 (IV
of 1969), in Clause (2), in sub-Clause (2), for the words “three years of its clearance”,
the words “one year of its clearance through green channels” shall be substituted.

2. Amendment of the Sales Tax Act, 1990: In the Sales Tax Act 1990, in Clause (3);

i In sub-clause(1);

(a) in paragraph (a), the proviso shall be omitted; {dissent by Senator Mohsin
Aziz) ;

(b)  paragraph (b), shall be omitted;

i. sub-clause (2), shall be omitted;

iii. in sub-clause (3), in the table, in column (2), in first entry ; (dissent by
Senator Musadik Masood Malik);

(a) in paragraph (i), for the words “five hundred thousand” the words “two
bundred and fifty thousand” shall be substituted ;

(b) in paragraph (ii), for the words “on million” the words “five hundred
thousand”, and thereafier for the words “fifteen days” the words “one
month” shall be substituted;

() in paragraph (iii), for the words “two million™ the words “one millioa™ and
thereafter for the words “fifteen days™ the words “one month” shall be
substituted;

(d) in paragraph (iv), for the words “three million” the words “one million and
five hundred thousand” and thereafier for the words “fifteen days” the words
“one month™ shall be substituted; and

(¢)  in paragraph (iv), in the first proviso, for the words “fificen days” the words
“one month” shall be substituted.

ii. In sub-clause (5), in paragraph (a), sub-paragraph (i) shall be omitted; and

iii.  In sub-clause (6), in the Table, in the 2" row, serial No. 66B , and the
corresponding entries relating thereto, shall be omitted.

3. Amendment of the Income Tax Ordinance, 2001(Ordinance XLIX of
2001): the Income Tax Ordinance, 2001{Ordinance XLIX of 2001), in Clause 4:

i. sub —clause (1) shall be omitted;

il sub- clause (4), shall be omitted; (“In such a case serious action shall be
taken through confiscation of property if the transfer is made worth 10 million
for the immovable property and vehicle over 1000cc”, The dissent note by
Senator Mohsin Aziz and Kamil Ali Agha)

jii. in sub-clause (6), paragraph (a), shall be omitted; antﬂﬁ?/ p
3



iv. sub-clauses (7), (9), (10),(11), (12) and (13) shall be -:::mj_mﬂd;

-~

pe
A !
8. The Bill laid in the Senate is placed at Annex-“A”. '
! b
| S
1) Y
{Iffat Mustafa) (Senator Muha Talha Mahmoo«d)

Secretary Committee Committee



[AS LAID BEFORE THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY]

ORDINANCE No. XXII nF 2021
AN
(RDINANCE
Surther to amend certain tux laws

WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend certain tax laws for the
purposes hereinafter appeanng,

AND WHEREAS, the Senate and the National Assembly are not in session
and the President of the Islamic Republic of Pakistan is satisficd that
circumstances exist which render it necessary to take immediate action;

NOW, THEREFORF, in exercise of the powers conferrad by clause (1) of
Article 89 of the Constitulion of the Islamic Republic of Pakistan, the President
of the lslamic Republic of Pakistan is pleased to make and promulgate the
following Ordinance;—

1. Short tile and commencement.—-(|) This Ordinance shall be
called the Tax Laws (Third Amendment) Ordinance, 2021,

{2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendments of Customs Act, 1969 (IV of 1969).—In the
Customs Act, 1969 (TV of 1969), the following further amendments shall be
made, namely; -

(1} in section 2513, in the proviso, for full stop at the end a colon shall
be substituted and thereafter the following second proviso shall be
added, namely.—

“Provided further that a person aggrieved of the wvalue
determined by the Director General Valuation may within thirty
days of commuaication of such order, prefer an appeal to the
Member Customs (Policy) who may pass an order annulling,
modifying or confirming the order passed by the Director
General.™; :

(21 1in section 80, in sub-section (3}, for the words “if during the
checking of goods declaration™, the expression “Notwithstanding
anything contaired in this Acl, if during the checking of goods
declaration or within three years of its clearance under sub-gection (1)
of section 83" shall be substituted;

{3} in section 81, in sub-section (1),—

(a) after the words “bank guarantee” wherever occurring, the
expression * corporate guarantee’ shall be inserted,;

(b} in the sccond proviso, for full stop at the end a colon shall be
substitetad and thereafter the [ollowing third proviso shall be
added. namelyv:—

“Trovided further that no provisional determination of
value Shall be allowed in those cases where a valuation
rubing(¥R} 15 in {ield, ivespective of the fact whether any
revigw o revision against that VR is pending in terms of
secion 230 oy relevanl rules, as the cuse may be'

[Publishea in the Gazette or Fakistan, extraordinary, Part-1, dated the 16™ September, 2021)

-



e

(4) insection i94A, in sub-section (1), clause () shall be omitted; and

(5) in section 196, in sub-section (1), after the expression “19413", the
expression “or order of the Member Customs (Policy) under
sections 25D and 212B" shall be inserted;

3. Amendments of the Sales Tax Act, 1990.—In the Sales Tax Act,
1990, the following further amendments shall be made, namely'——

(1) insection 3, —

(a)

(b)

in sub-section (7), for the full stop at the end, a colon shall be
substituted and thereafter the following proviso shall be
added, namely:—

“Provided thal in case of the online market place
facilitating the sale of third party goods, the liability to
withhoid tax on taxable supplies of such parly ut the rates
specified in column (4) against S, No. 8 of the Fleventh
Schedule to this Act, shall be on the aperator of such market
place."”; and

after sub-section (9AA), the following new sub-section shall
be added, namely:—

“(10) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, the

Board may, by notification in the official Guazette,
require any person or class of persons to integrate their
invoice issuing machines with the Board's computerized
system for real time reporting of sales in such mode and
manner and from such date as may be prescribed.";

(2) after section 14, the following new section 14A shall be added,
namely.—-

Y144,

Discontinuance of gas and electricity connections.—
Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or any other
law for the time being in force, the Board shall have power
through sales tax peneral order to direct the gas and electricity
distribution companies for discontinuing the gas and
¢lectricity connections of any person who falls in the
following categories, namely:—

(a) any person, including tier-1 retnilers, who fails to
register for sales tax purpose; or



- "

notified tier-] retailers registered but not integrated with
the Board's computerized system:

Provided that upon registration or integration, as the
cas¢ may be, of the above said persons, the Board shall
notify the restoration of their gas or electricity
connection through sales tax general order.™;

{3} insection 33, in the Table, in column (1)~

(&)

(b)

against 5. No.25,

(1)

(i1)

in column (2), for the expression “sub-section (9A) of
seciion 3 or section 40C, as the case may be”, the
expression “section 40C shall be substituted; and

i column (3), the expression “sub-section (9A) of
section 3 and” shall be omitted; and

after 8. No. 25 and entries refating thereto in columns {(2) and
{3), amendcd as aforesaid, the following new 5. No. 25A and
corresponding entries relating thereto shall be inserted,
namely:—

25A. A person required to [Such person shall be liable to | Sub-section (9A) of
integrate his business | pay— section 3
as stipulated under '
sub-section (9A) of | (i) Penalty of five hundred

section 3, who fails to thousanid nmipees for first

get himself registered . defauli,

under the Act, and if

registered, fails 1o | (ii) penalty of one million

integrate in the manner rupeas for second default :
a5 required under the after fifteen days of order |

law and rules
i thereunder,

made for first defanly;

| (1) penalty of two million
rupees for third default
after fifteen davs of order
for second Jefault;

{iv) penalty of thtee million |
rupees for fourth default
after fifteen days of order
for third default:

Provided that iff such
person fails to inteprate his Il




— 4 -

1]

business within fifteen days |

of imposition of penalty for
fourth default, his business
premisces shall be sealed rill
fuch time he integrates his
business in the manner as
stipulated under zub section
(9A) of section 3;

Provided further that if
the retailer integrates his

husiness with the Board's |

computerized svsiem hefore
impusition of penalty for
second default, penalty for
first default shall be waived
by the Commissioner.

e e e

{(4) 1n the Fifth Schedule, in column (1), against S. No 17, in column
{2), the words “excluding that sold in retail packing under a brand
name or a trademark™ shal! be omitad;

{5) in the Sixth Schedule, in column (1} —

{a) in Table-1,—

(1)

(if)

(iif)

{(b) in Table-3, in the Annexure, in column (1),—

(1)

against Serial No. 15, in column (2), the expression
“(except fruits imported from Afghanistan)” shall be

omitted;

against Serial No. 159, in column (2), for the expression
“30th June, 20217, the expression “3lst December,
2021" shall be substituted; and

against Serial No. 160, in column (2), for the expression
“30th Jume, 20217, the expression “31st December,
2021 shall be substituted,

after 8. No. 2 and entries relating thereto in colunms (2),
{3) and (4), the following new S, No. 2A and entries



-

relating thereto in columns (2), (3) and (4) shall be
inserted, namely:—

e 1
il
™

The following aw
i materials  1mported

 registered manufacturer of

auto disabled s:mngcs

This concession is available
to registered manufacturers
of auto disabled synnges
with quota determination by

10CO and subject to NOC

(1) Printing paper _ 48025500 | oo Ministry of National
(2) Polypropylene 3902.1000 | Health Services Regulation

(3) Propylene copolymers | 3902.3000 e

(4) Plasticized | 3904.2200

=

{5) Epoxide Resins

| 3907.3000

(6) Bioxially Oriented | 3920.2040
Folypropylene (BOPP
filma, laminated)

{ii) against 5. No, 21, for the entry in column (4), the
expression’ “import of POS machines including
credit/debit cards terminals and retailer cash register.”
shall be substituted,

(6) in the Eighth Schedule, in Table-1 in column (1),—-

{a) S. No. 60 and entries relating thereto in columns (2), (3), (4)
and (5) shall be omitted;

{b) after serial 66 and entries relating thereto in columns (2), (3),
(4) and (35), the following new S. No. 66A and correspoading
entries relating thereto shall be inserted, namely:—

"a6A

Supplies e:cIuding| Respective 16% | If payment s
those specified in headings made through
5. No. 66, as made digital mode.
from retail outlets
integrated with Board's
Computerized System
for real time reporting
of sales

66B.

Import of remeltabic Respective | 14% | If imported Ejr'_
scrap : headings | steel melters.”

; and




-6~

(¢) afler §. No. 74 and entries zelating thereto in columns
{2}, (3). (4) and (5), the following new 5. No. and entries
relating thereto in colurans (2), (3}, (4) and (5) shall be
added, namely:—

in CBU conditions
Business to  busincss
transactions specified by

fm—— =

[--?5. Import of electric vehicle | 8703.8090 | 3%
|
Fl

i the Beard through a . If payment is
| 76. [.notification in  official R.I::spd::a_ctwc 16.9% |made through
{ Gazette subject to such | FARE digital mode.".
conditions and restrictions |
i as specified therein, !

4.  Amendments of the Income Tax Ordinance, 2001 (Ordinance
XLIX of 2001)—In the Income Tax Ordinance, 2001 (XLIX of 2001), the
following further amendments shall be made, namely; —

(1) insection 2],

(a) in clause (I}, after the word “any expenditure”, vccurring for
the first time, the expression “by a taxpayer not being a
s company” shall be inserted;

() after clause (I), amended as aforcsaid, the following new
clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(la) any expenditure by a taxpayer being a company for &
transaction, paid or payable under a single account head
which, in aggregate, exceeds two hundred and fifty
thousand rupees, made other than by digital means from
business bank account of the taxpayer notified to the
Commissioner under section 1 14A:

Provided that this clause shall not apply in the case of—

(i) expenditures not exceeding twenty-five thousand
rupees;

(ii) expenditures on account of -
(A) wtlity bills;
(B) freight charges;



(2)

(3)

- (4)

..-7""

(C) travel fare,
(D) postage; and

(I5) payment of taxes, duties, fee, fines or any
other statutory obligation; and

(c) 1n clause (m), after the word “account” the expression “or
through digital mode™ shall be inserted;

in section 53. in sub-section (2), after the word "The" ocenrring for
the first time the expression “Federal Government or the" shall be
inserted;

in section 111, after sub-section (4), the following new explanation
ghall be added, namely;,—

“Explanation.—For removal of doubt, it is clarified that the
remittance through money service bureaus (MCBs), exchange
companies (ECs) and money fransfer operators (MTOs) such as
Western Union, Money Gram and Ria Finance or other like entities
shall be deemed to constitute foreign exchange remitted from
outside Pakistan through normal banking channels as delincated
under this sub-section.'

after seclion 114A, the fnflmﬁng new section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“i114B. Powers to enforce filing of returns.—(l) Notwithstanding

anything contained in any other law for the time being in
force, the Board shall have the powers to issuc income tax
general order in respect of persons who are not appearing on
ATL but are liable to file return under the provisions of this

Ordinance.

(2) The income tax general order issued under sub-section (1)
may entail any or all of the following consequences for the
persons mentioned therein, namely:—

{a) disabling of mobile phones or mobile phone sims;
(b} discontinuance of electncity connection;
(c) and discontinuance of gas connection.

(3) The Board or the Commissioner having jurisdiction over the
person mentioned in the income tax general order may order



(4)

(5)

- 8 -

restoration of mobile phoncs, mobile phone sims and
connections of electricity and gas, in cases where he is
satisfied that —

{a) the return has been filed; or

{b) person was not liable to file reum under the provisions
of this Ordinance.

No person shall be included in the general order under
sub-section (1) unless following conditions have been mel
with, namely:—

(a) notice under sub-section (4) of section 114 has been
issued;

(b} date of compliance of the notice under sub-section (4) of
section 114 has elapsed; and

{c) the person has not filed the retum.

The action under this section shall not preclude any other
action provided under the provisions of this Ordinance.";

. (5) after section 175A, the following new scction shall be mserted,
namely: —

*175B.

(1)

(2)

National Database and Registration Authority (NADRA).

The National Database and Registration Authority shall, on its
own motion or upon application by the Board, share its
records and any information available or held by it, with the
Board, for broadening of the tax base or carrying out the
purposes of this Ordinance.

The National Databasc and Regiswation Authority may—

(i) submit proposals and information 1o the Board with a
view to broadening the tax base;

(ii) identify in relation to any person, whether a taxpayer or
not —

(a) income, receipts, assets, propertics, liabilities,
expenditures, or transactions that have escaped
assessment or are under-assessed or have been
assessed at a low rate, or have been subjected to



(3)

(4)

(3)

(6)

(7)

-9 -

excessive relief or refund or have been misdeciared
or misclassified under a particular head of income
or otherwise;

(b) the value of anything mentioned in sub-clause (a)
of clause (ii), if such value is at variance with the
value notified by the Board or the district
authorities, as the case may be, or if no such value
has been notified the true or market value; and

(iii) enter into a memorandum of understanding with the
Board for a secure exchange and utilization of a person’s
infarmatian.

The Board may use and utilize any information communicated
to it by the Natignal Database and Registration Authority and
forward such information to an income tax authority having
jurisdiction in relation to the subject matter regarding the
information, who may utilize the information for the purposes
of this Ordinance.

The WNational Database and Registration Authority may
compute indicative income and tax liability of anyone
mentioned under sub-sections (1) or (2) by use of artificial
intelligence, mathematical or statistical modeling or any other
maodern device or caloulation method

The indicative income and tax liability computed by the
National Database and Registration Authority under sub-
section (4) shall be nolified by the Board to the person in
respeet of whom such indicative income and tax liability has
been determined, who shall have the option to pay the
determined amount on such terms, conditions, installments,
discounts, reprieves pertaining to penalty and default
surcharge, and time limits that may be prescribed by the
Board.

In case the person against whom a liability has been
determined under sub-section (4), does not pay such liability
within the time prescribed under sub-section (5), the Board
shall take action under this Ordinance, upon the basis of tax
liability computed under sub-section (4).

If the person against whom the liability has been determined
under sub-section (4) pays such liability in terms of
sub-scction (5), such payment shall be construed to be an



(8)

= }‘0 -

amended asscssment order under section 120 or sub-scction
(1) of section 122 or sub-szction (4) of section 122 as the case
may be.

For the purposes of sub-sections (4) and (5). the Board may
prescribe the extent of instaliments, reprieves pertaining (o
penalty and default surcharge and time limits."”;

(6) insection 182, in sub-section (1), in the Table, in column (1),

(a}

(b)

sgainst 8, No. |, for the entry in columm (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-—

“Such person shall pay a penalty equal to higher of

{(a) 0.1 % of the 1ax payable in respect of that tax year for
each day of default; or

{(b) rupees one thousand for each day of default:
Provided that minimum penalty shall be—

(a) rupees ten thousand in case of individual having
seventy-five percent or more income from salary, or

(b) rupeey fifty thousand in all other cases:

Provided further that maximum penalty shall not exceed
two hundred percent of tax payable by the person in a tax
year:

Provided also that the amount of penally shall be
reduced by 75%, 50% and 25% if the return ig filed within
one, two and three months respectively after the due date or
extended due date of filing of return as prescribed under the
law:;

Explanation—For the purposes of this entry, il is
declared thal thc expression “tax payable” means tax
chargeable on the taxable income on the basis of assessment
made or treated to have been made under sections 120, 121,
122 or 122D

S, Nu.14 and entries relating thereto in columns (1), (2), (3)
and (4) shall be omitted and shall always be deemed to have
been so omitted since the commencement of the Income Tax
Ordinance, 2001 (XLIX of 2001).";



N

(7) section 198 shall be omitted and shall always be deemed to have
been so omitted since the commencement of the Income Tax
Ordinanee, 2001 (XLIX of 2001);

(8) in section 216, in sub-section (3), clause {(kb) shall be omitted;
(9) insection 235,—

(a) eafter sub-sectien (1), the following new sub-section shall be
added, namely:;—

“(1A) In addition to tax collectable under sub-section (1), there
skall b= collecied additional advance tax at the rates given
in the Division-IV of Part-IV of the First Schedule from
professionals not appearing on ATL and operating from
residential premises having domestic electric connections
from electricity distribution companies.

For the purposes of this sub-section professionals include
accountants, . lawyers, doctors, dentists, health
professionals, . engineers, architects, IT professionals,
witors, lrainers and other persons engaged in provision of
services,™;
(b) in sub-section (4), in clause (c), after the word “company”, the
expression * or domestic consumer” shall be inserted;

(10} In the First Schedule, in Pari-IV, in Division-IV, after the omitted
clause (2), the following new clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2A) The rate of additicnal advance tax under sub-section (1A) of
section 235 shall be collected from the gross amount of the
electricity bills at the rates given below:—

i Rate of
Sr. No. Description additional tax

M L (2 N (3)

1 Where the bill does not excesd 10,000 rupees 5%

2 Where the bill excesds 10,000 rupees but 10%

does not exceed 20,000 rupess
3 | Where the bill exceeds 20,000 rupces bul 15%
i does not exce=d 30,000




-

- B | Rateof |
e T, Description additional tax
! 2) . (3) )
Where the bill exceeds 30.000 rupees but 20%
does not cxceed 4ﬂ ﬂﬂu i
Where thc bﬂl cxceeds 40,000 rupees 25%
but does not exceed 50,000
1' Where the blll exceeds 50, ﬂ{!l} rupees :. 30%
; but does not exceed 75,000 :
[ ¥ AL R AL TR S e i -
{ | Where the b:ll exn:uds 78, DD'D rupccs 35%", |

{(11) inthe Second Schedule,—

(A) in Par-l, in clause (66}, in sub-clause (1), in the Table 1, in
column (1),—

(i) S. Nos. (xhx) to (xlxv} shall be re-numbered as 5. Nos. (1)
to (Iv) respectively;

(ii) after S. No. (Iv), re-nambered as aforesaid, and cntnies
relating thercto in column (2), the following new catry
shall be added, namely:—

(B} inPart II,—

(i) in clause (24C), after the word “cement” the expression *,
steel” shall be mserted; and

(i) in clause (24D), after the word “ccment” the expression ™,
steel™ shall be inserted, and

(C) in Part-IV, in clause (11A), after the sub-clause (xliv),
following new sub-clause shall be added, namely: -

"“(xIv) | Mobile phone manufacturers cngaged in the local '
manufacturing of mobile phone devices.”;




(12)

(13)

« 187

it the Seventh Schedule, in rule 6C, in sub-rulc (6A), for the word
“assets”, wherever occurring, the word “gross advances” shall be
substituted; and

in the Thirteenth Schedule, in the Table 1, in column (1), after
S No. 62 and entries relating thereto in column (2), the following
S. No and entry relating thereto shall be added, namely: —

L9463 | All entities mentioned in Table - 1 of clause (66) of
| Part-1 of the Second Schedule of the Ordinance.”.

L




1Y -

Statement of Objects and Reasons

The purpose of this bill is to lay the Tax Laws (Third Amendment)
Ordinance, 2021 (XXII of 2021) in the National Assembly under sub-
paragraph (i) of Paragraph (a) of clause (2) of Article 73 of the Constitution
of the Islamic Republic of Pakistan, 1973.

2. The Tax Laws (Third Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 incorporates
certain measures including broadening of tax base, promoting integration
of Tier-1 retailers with FBR's computerized sysiem, promoting digital
economy, providing relief to certain items etc. Through further
amendments in tax laws namely Customs Act, 1969, Salcs Tax Act, 1990
and Income Tax Ordinance, 2001.

3. In the Customs Act, 1969, the mechanisms regarding appeal against
the order of Director General Valuation and reassessment of declaration of
Goods is modified to ensure proper implementation of valuation rulings
and to avoid unnecessary litigation. Moreover, the definition of security
instyument is amended to include corporate gunrantees'.

4. In the Sales Tax Act, 1990, necessary amendments are made for
broadening of tax base, encouraging integration with FBR’s real time
reporting system and tightening of penal provisions for non-compliant
taxpayers. Marmvar, provisions relating to promoting digital economy and
correction of anomaly regarding allowing zcro rating to milk are also
included,

5, Similarly, in the Income Tax Ordinance, 2001, a new provision is
inserted for providing access of FBR data to NADRA for the purposes of
broadening of tax base and developing” citizen portal for calculating
indicative income and detecting tax evasion. Besides, some other measures
relating to promotion of digital economy, broadening of tax base and
streamlining procedures have been added.

6. The Ordinance seeks to amend the Customs Act, 1969 (IV of | 969), Sales Tax
Act, 1990 and the Income Tax Ordinance, 2001.

Shaukat Fayaz Atrmed Tarin
Minister for Finance and Revenue



